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...the Largest Circulating Daily of  the Islands

Since 1920s the Oldest Daily... Light rain and thunder/ lightning is very likely over

Port Blair.  Maximum and Minimum temperature

will be around 31° C  and 25°C respectively on

Friday 07/07/2023.

Maximum Temperature (°C) of Date: 31.0

Minimum Temperature (°C) of Date: 24.2

Relative Humidity (%) at 0830 IST : 080

Relative Humidity (%) at 1730 IST : 095

C M Y K

Sunrise time on 07.07.2023 (in IST): 0501

Sunset time on 07.07.2023 (in IST): 1748

Rainfall upto 0830 hrs of date (last 24 hrs)- in mm: 007.0

Rainfall upto 1730 hrs of date in mm: 008.7

Rainfall (Progressive total from 1st January  23 upto 0830 hrs

(of date) in mm: 906.8 mm

1. "Trees are the

lungs of the world."

Sriharikota, July 6
  Indian Space Research
Organisation (ISRO)
said that Chandrayaan 3
will be launched on the
14 th  of this month
around 2:35 PM from
Satish Dhawan Space
Centre, Sriharikota. In a
tweet, ISRO gave this
information. ISRO will
launch its ambitious
Chandrayaan-3 Mission
aimed at demonstrating
critical technology to
land the spacecraft on
the Moon.

     Chandrayaan-3 is a
follow-on mission to
Chandrayaan-2 to
demonstrate end-to-end
capability in safe

landing and roving on
the lunar surface. It
consists of Lander and
Rover configurations.
Chandrayaan-3 consists

of an indigenous
Lander module, a
Propulsion module, and
a Rover to develop and
demonstrate new
technologies required
for Interplanetary
missions. Safe and soft
landing on the lunar
surface, rover roving on
the Moon, and
conducting in-situ
scientific experiments
are the key mission
objectives of
C h a n d r a y a a n - 3 .
(Source: india.gov.in)

Chandrayaan 3 to be launched on
14th July from Sriharikota: ISRO

Major Cancer Surgery done for 1st time

on 4 year old child at GBPH/ ANIIMS

Large abdominal tumor removed

through advanced Laproscopic Surgery

Mayabunder, July 6
       A meeting of the
District Cooperative
D e v e l o p m e n t
Committee (DCDC),
North & Middle
Andaman District was
held today in the
Conference Hall of DC
Office, Mayabunder
under the chairmanship
of Shri Ankit Yadav,
IAS, Deputy
Commissioner, North &
Middle Andaman
District, who is also the
Chairman of the
C o m m i t t e e .
Representatives from
NABARD, NFDB,
District Cooperative
Fisheries Federation
and local Heads of
Offices of all line
D e p a r t m e n t s
( C o o p e r a t i o n ,
Agriculture, AH&VS &
Fisheries) attended the
meeting. In the meeting,
matters relating to
implementation of the
plan for strengthening

cooperative movement
and deepening its reach
to the grassroot level in
North & Middle

Andaman District were
reviewed and
discussed.
    The working of  28

PACS registered under
North & Middle
Andaman District were
reviewed and it was
directed for making
amendments in bye-
laws in terms of
adoption of provision of
model bye-laws of
PACS issued by the
Ministry of Cooperation,
Govt. of India. The
matter relating to

Meeting of District Cooperative Development

Committee of N&M Andaman District held

Matters relating to implementation of plan for

strengthening cooperative movement & deepening

its reach to grassroot level reviewed & discussed
Working of 28 PACS registered under

the District reviewed

Port Blair, July 6
      The A&N
Administration has
invited online
applications through
Administration's Portal:
h t t p s : / / k a r m i c .
a n d a m a n . g o v . i n /
grpcmatric for filling up
of various Group ‘C’

Matric Level Posts in
different Departments
under A & N

Administration vide
Vacancy Notice No. 4-
13/2022-R&E Cell dated
29.04.2023 and the
Written Examination is
scheduled to be held on
09.07.2023.
     The A & N
Administration has
once again requested all
the candidates who
have registered online
applications for various

Group ‘C’ Matric Level
Posts to download their
Admit Card on https://
karmic.andaman.gov.in/
grpcmatric and also
adhere to the following
p r e - e x a m i n a t i o n
instruction: -
The candidates who
are likely to be present
at the centre/venue of
ANIIMS have been

Recruitment to Group 'C' Matric Level Posts in

various Departments under A & N Administration
Written exam to be held on July 9; candidates asked to download

Admit Card online & adhere to instructions specified

Port Blair, July 6
        A 4 year old male
child was referred by a
local Pediatrician with
complaints of recurrent
upper abdominal pain
and fever for 3-4 months
duration. The child was
admitted in the
Department of General
& Minimal Access
Surgery and was further
investigated with blood
test, USG abdomen &
contrast CT abdomen
which revealed a large
tumor of size 10x8 cm
arising above the right
kidney from the right

adrenal gland. The child
was prepared for an
elective major advanced
Laparoscopic Surgery to
remove the tumor.
    A team of Doctors
comprising of Surgeon,
Dr. Saji Vargheese &
Anesthetists, Dr. Sarasa
Kumar Sahoo & Dr.
Narayanan and staff
performed a major
surgery through 5 key
holes measuring 5-10
mm lasting for 4 ½ hours
recently. The large
tumor was completely
removed from the
abdomen which was

located between the
right kidney and the
liver. Post-operation, the
child was kept in
Surgical ICU and started
on Oral feeds on the 2nd

day and discharged on
6th day.
     The child was
reviewed after 3 weeks
with biopsy report as
N e u r o b l a s t o m a
(Malignant tumor
arising from the adrenal
gland). For further
characterization of the
tumor, the slides were
sent for N-Myc gene
amplification Assay to

the Department of FISH
& Cytogenetics of
Oncquest Laboratories,
New Delhi.
   Now, the child is
being planned to be
started on
chemotherapy regimen.
It is pertinent to mention
here that such a major
Cancer Surgery was
done Laparoscopically
for the 1st time in a child
at GB Pant Hospital/
ANIIMS. Post surgery,
the child is on the path
of recovery and is doing
very well, a press release
from ANIIMS said.

Circuit Court at

Port Blair from

July 17 to 28
Port Blair, July 6
    Hon'ble Justice
Tapabrata Chakraborty
and Hon'ble Justice
Raja Basu Chowdhury,
Judges of the Calcutta
High Court shall be
sitting/holding Circuit
Court at Port Blair from
July 17 to 28, 2023, a
press release from
Registrar, Circuit Bench
Calcutta High Court,
Port Blair said.

Port Blair, July 6
      As  part of the
celebration of World
Zoonoses Day, a
Symposium on the
theme 'Preparedness for
future epidemic/
pandemic lessons
learned from COVID-19'
was conducted by
RMRC, Port Blair in
association with DHS
and Dept of AH&VS,
A&N Administration
today in the auditorium
of RMRC. The
symposium witnessed
participation of Doctors
from DHS, AH&VS,

ANIIMS, Staff of E&F,
CIARI and RMRC, Port
Blair and faculty from
JNRM Port Blair besides
representatives from
UNDP, India through
online and offline modes.
    On this occasion, Dr.
Eknath Chakurkar,

Director, CIARI was the
Mentor.  The topic of
discussion was on
'Zoonotic Diseases in
A&N Islands'. The
speakers were Dr. Avijit
Roy, DDH, Dr. KA
Naveen,  Director

Symposium on 'Preparedness for future epidemic/

pandemic lessons learned from COVID-19' marks

observance of World Zoonoses Day in Isles
Experts deliberates on ways to prevent outbreak of

zoonoses diseases in Isles through data sharing

Port Blair, July 6
     All the candidates
who appeared in the
Computer Based Test
held on 26.06.23 and
27.06.23 for the post of
Computer Assistant Gr.
'A' in the Amalgamated
IT Cadre of A & N
Administration, have
been informed that the
answer keys of the
question paper sets has
been published in the
A & N State Portal
( h t t p s : / /

www.andaman.gov.in)
and e-recruitment Portal
(https://erecruitment.
andaman.gov.in).
   If any discrepancy is
found in the answer
keys, the claims/
objections related to the
same may be submitted
to the Department of IT
through the email id
dit.ana.pb@gmail.com
on or before 08.07.23, a
press release from
Officer on Special Duty
(IT) said.

Answer keys of Computer Based Test held

for post of Computer Assistant Gr. 'A' in

Amalgamated IT Cadre published online

Port Blair, July 6
   The provisional
statement of marks of
eligible candidates and
list of ineligible
candidates for the post of
PGT/PET/Librarian
Gr.II/CI/PSRT who have
applied for these posts in

response to Vacancy
notification published in
'The Daily Telegrams' on
04/05/2023 and 05/05/
2023 has been uploaded
in the website of
Directorate of Education
h t t p s : / /
edurec.andaman.gov.in.

Provisional Statement of Marks of eligible candidates &

list of ineligible candidates for the post of PGT/PET/

Librarian Gr.II/CI/PSRT uploaded in website
   It may be noted that the
provisional statement of
marks does not confer
any right to candidates to
get selection for any post.
The Department holds
the right to modify,
change and cancel the

Campbell Bay, July 6
     The Directorate of
Disaster Management,
A&N Administration
in coordination with
District Administration,
Nicobar, Indian Coast
Guard (A&N) and 4 Bn,
National Disaster
Response Force
organized a 12 days
Disaster Management
Training from June 22
to July 6, 2023 at
Community Hall,
Campbell Bay for
C o m m u n i t y

Volunteers (Aapda
Mitras) of Great
Nicobar under  Up-
scaling of Aapda Mitra
Scheme. The scheme
aims to train 300
C o m m u n i t y

Volunteers (Aapda
Mitras) in A&N Islands.
   During the
concluding session, the
chief  guest, Shri
Abhishek Gulia,

DM training for 4th batch of Community Volunteers

(Aapda Mitras) concludes at Campbell Bay
Participants urged to implement lessons learnt

from training during hazardous situation

Port Blair, July 6
    This is clarified to the
candidates that the
reservation benefits for
ST category is
applicable only to those
STs as specified in the
Constitutional Order
No. 1959 of A & N
Islands (Scheduled
Tribes). Besides, the

reservation benefits for
OBC category are
applicable only to those
OBCs as specified in the
A&N Administration's
Circular No. 8-3/2003-
TW dated 30th  March,
2006,  in the direct
recruitment of various
posts of A&N Police
Department.

Recruitment to various posts in A&N Police Department

Reservation benefit for ST & OBC categories in

recruitment process will be given to candidates who

possess certificates issued by A&N Administration
   The certificates
issued by A&N
Administration in this
regard will only be
acceptable and
considered for
extending the
reservation benefits for
ST and OBC Category,
a press release from
A&N Police said.

Port Blair, July 6
      Candidates
scheduled to appear for
the Computer Based
Test for recruitment to
various posts under
Health Department
from 11.07.2023 to
14.07.2023 at DBRAIT
and are presently
stationed at Nicobar

District or Little
Andaman may submit
their Registration
Number, Name and
Father's name by email
to recruitmentcelldhs
@gmail.com  or through
Whatsapp at
9434283135, if they wish
to postpone their exam
to 15.07.2023, in view of

the non-availability of
ship schedule after the
r e c r u i t m e n t

Computer Based Test for recruitment to various posts in Health Deptt.

Candidates of Nicobar District & Little Andaman desiring

postponement of exam due to non availability of ship

schedule asked to submit details by July 7

(Contd. on last page)

(Contd. on last page) (Contd. on last page)

(Contd. on last page)

(Contd. on last page)

(Contd. on last page)

Port Blair, July 6
       The vacancy notice
for recruitment to the
post of Senior
Investigator/Assistant
Statistical Officer
(Group B Non-
Gazetted) & Junior
Investigator (Group C) in
the Directorate of
Economics & Statistics,
A&N Administration &
Junior Investigator (AH)
(Group C) in the
Directorate of Animal
Husbandry &
Veterinary Services was

uploaded in
A d m i n i s t r a t i o n ' s
website/portal i.e. https:/
/ e r e c r u i t m e n t .
andaman.gov.in/CRAP
on 10.6.2023 & 1.6.2023
respectively, inviting
applications from
eligible candidates.
    In this regard,
candidates have been
informed that the
R e c r u i t m e n t
Examination through
Computer Based Test
will be held on 17.7.2023

Exam for Junior Investigator (DES and

AH & VS) to be held on July 17 & 18;

Senior Investigator/ Assistant

Statistical Officer on July 19 at DBRAIT

(Contd. on last page)
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SBM Ambassador visits

GSSS Garacharama

Port Blair, July 6
     To check cleanliness
and sanitation under
Swachh Bharat Abhiyan,
Shri Naresh Chander Lal,
Padmashri Awardee and
Ambassador Swachh
Bharat Mission, A&N
Islands visited Govt.
Senior Secondary School
Garacharama today and
interacted with the
students and teachers and
urged them to maintain
cleanliness and sanitation
in their school premises as

well as in their respective
societies. He urged the
students and teachers not
to waste water and to
keep themselves away
from alcoholism and
drugs.
   He also interacted with
the teachers during the
CRC level seminar. The
Vice Principal, Smti
Sunita Chakraborty
accompanied him during
the visit, a press release
from SBM Ambassador
said.

Heavy rain likely to occur in Isles

Port Blair, July 6
       Heavy rain (7-11cm) is
likely to occur at one or
two places over A&N
Islands on July 9 & 10.  For
further enquiries/
information, one may
contact helpline of State
Emergency Operation
Centre at Helpline No.

1070 & District
Emergency Operation
Centre at Helpline No.
1077. For any emergency/
assistance at sea, call
Coast Guard SAR Agency
at Toll Free number 1554,
a press release from
Directorate of Disaster
Management said.

Plantation & cleanliness program

organized at PHC Wimberlygunj

Port Blair, July 6
  As part of the observance
of Van Mahotsav, A.K.
Brothers Youth Club, Lal
Bijan, Wimberlygunj
organized a plantation and
cleanliness drive at PHC
Wimberlygunj on July 2,

2023. Dr. K.P. Felicitus,
CMO, HWC
Wimberlygunj, ex
Pradhan, Wimberlygunj,
Shri Manikam were
present on the occasion, a
press release from CMO,
HWC Wimberlygunj said.

74th Van Mahotsav celebrated at

RGCTC ; seedlings of various fruit

bearing species planted
Port Blair, July 6
  Rajiv Gandhi
Cooperative Training
Centre, NCUI,
Teylerabad and the South
Andaman Forest Division
under the chairmanship
of Shri Kuldeep Rai
Sharma, Chairman,
ANSCU jointly
celebrated the 74th Van
Mahotsava, a tree planting
programme at Andaman
& Nicobar State
Cooperative Union
Complex, Teylerabad
yesterday. The Officers
and Range Officers
spoke on the importance
of forest and environment
and significance of Van
Mahotsava. Altogether 75

persons from ANSCU
and Forest Department
participated in the
programme. More than 60
seedlings of various fruit
bearing plant  species and
plants of economic
importance provided by
Forest Department were
planted, a press release
from RGCTC said.

  DSS to issue unsold tickets of vessel

Nalanda scheduled to sail for Chennai

Port Blair, July 6
   The Directorate of
Shipping Services will be
issuing unsold/remaining
passenger tickets to Little
Andaman/Nancowry/
Campbell Bay bound
passengers in the vessel
Nalanda which is
scheduled to sail for
Chennai via Little
Andaman, Nancowry &
Campbell Bay on
08.07.2023 at 1000 hrs from
Haddo Wharf. In this

regard, passengers who
wish to avail the sailing up
to Little Andaman/
Nancowry/Campbell Bay
may purchase their tickets
on 07.07.2023  from 1400
hrs onwards. Passengers
may book their tickets from
DSS e-ticketing portal
( h t t p s : / /
dss.andaman.gov.in/
ShipETicketingWeb/
L o g i n . j s p ) / S T A R S
Ticketing Counters, a press
release from DSS said.

computerization and operation of CSC by PACS were also discussed.
Regarding computerization of PACS, it was informed that all 28 PACS have
entered their data in computerized software and Field Verification Report
of the concerned PACS by the officials of the Cooperative Department is
currently underway. Presently, 4 PACS are functioning as CSC and 4 more
PACS are in pipeline to start functioning. The Deputy Commissioner, N&M
Andaman on the matter of 'Decentralized Grain Storage Plan through PACS'
has asked to conduct a feasibility study of the project in the District. The
SVO of the Animal Husbandry Department was directed to conduct field
survey among cattle farmers and explore the possibilities for forming Dairy
Cooperatives at village level so that micro level food processing unit can be
set up. Regarding setting up of Jan Aushadhi Kendra for improving access
to generic medicines at rural level, it was directed by the DC to identify
PACS who are interested in carrying out the business. Similarly, it was also
directed to encourage PACS to operate Pradhan Mantri Kisan Samriddhi
Kendras for fertilizer distribution. Regarding formation of Farmer Producer
Organizations (FPOs), the Deputy Commissioner directed the Assistant
Director of Agriculture & Fisheries Department to provide guidance
regarding guidelines and procedures for registration of FPOs involving
farmers and fishermen to District Fisheries Cooperative Federation in
coordination with NABARD.
    Specific directions were also issued by the Deputy Commissioner, N&M
Andaman to all concerned Departments to coordinate with all stakeholders
and provide all necessary support for ensuring implementation of plan,
especially Central Schemes, at the ground level in a time bound manner. It
was also directed to create awareness & promotions of all the schemes at
village level and tangible progress should be made in each sector, a press
release from Deputy Registrar of Cooperative Societies, North & Middle
Andaman District said.

Meeting of District Cooperative Development Committee...
(Contd. from page 1)

Recruitment to Group 'C' Matric Level Posts in  ...
(Contd. from page 1)

directed to appear at ANIIMS Campus, near Corbyn's Cove, Port Blair.
Candidate shall report to the Centre well in advance before 2 hours from
the commencement of examination to reach the centre given in the Admit
Card and avoid any crowding at the centre at the time of commencement of
examination.
No candidate should adopt any unfair means or indulge in any unfair
examination practices as the examination centres are under surveillance of
CCTV and equipped with jammers.
 The PwBD candidate must bring PwBD certificate issued by the
Competent Authority, if claiming Scribe under PwBD category must also
carry his/ her own and scribe Self Declaration (Undertaking) regarding
educational qualification, etc., passport size photograph, valid Government
identity card. The PwBD candidates who have obtained certificate regarding
physical limitation for an examinee to write from the Chief Medical Officer/
Civil Surgeon/Medical Superintendent of Government Health Care
Institution must also bring her/his Own Scribe to be present a day in advance
to the Centre Superintendent to certify himself /herself.
 Candidate must carry 'Any one of the original and valid Photo
Identification Proof issued by the Government' - PAN/Driving License/Voter
ID/Aadhaar/Islander Card with Photo. All other ID/Photocopies of IDs even
if attested/scanned photo of IDs in mobile phone will NOT be considered
as valid ID Proof.
Candidates have been suggested to visit the examination venue, a day in
advance to see the arrangements at the centre, so that they do not face any
problem on the day of examination. If religion/customs require you to wear
specific attire, visit centre early for thorough checking.
No candidate would be allowed to enter the Examination Centre, without
Admit Card, valid ID proof.
Candidate shall also refer to the instructions mentioned in Admit Card
and press note issued dated 05.07.2023 for more details, a press release
from Special Secretary (Personnel) said.

DM training for 4th batch of Community Volunteers...
(Contd. from page 1)

Assistant Commissioner, Great Nicobar appreciated the dedicated
participation of volunteers who have successfully completed the training
and prepared themselves to fight against any disaster situation as first
responders in the community level. He urged all participants to implement
what they have learned during the training in their life for SAR Operations
and CSSR in a calm manner for better response during hazardous situation
and coordinate from community level of their respective district and to the
State. He said, a trained and prepared mind will only save lives
professionally and effectively.
      Shri Sanjay Kumar Singh, Adhyaksh, Zilla Parishad, South Andaman
who also attended the concluding session of the training programme
highlighted on scheme of Government of India 'Up-scaling Aapda Mitra
Scheme' which will be funded from Preparedness and Capacity Building
Funding Window of National Disaster Response Fund. The scheme will
be implemented by National Disaster Management Authority (NDMA) in
partnership with State/UT Governments and State Disaster Management
Authorities. The scheme focuses on training of 1,00,000 community
volunteers in 350 highly vulnerable districts prone to flood, landslide,
cyclone and earthquake in India by March 2024, he said.
      On the occasion, the guest of honour, Shri Brij Mohan Meena, Dy.
Superintendent of Police, Great Nicobar highlighted the importance of
disaster management trainings for the community volunteers for
responding to their community's immediate needs during and in the
aftermath of a disaster.
        The Commanding Officer, Shri J S Randhawa, Indian Coast Guard
(A&N), Campbell Bay elaborated on the importance of Disaster
Management Training which was imparted to Community Volunteers as
per the syllabus prescribed by the National Disaster Management
Authority, GoI, MHA, New Delhi on basics of Disaster Management,
vulnerability, various risks, search & rescue, medical first response and
improvising rescue equipment from the locally available resources.
       Shri Janik Ram, Asst. Director (Admn.) appreciated the participation
and cooperation of all for the successful completion of this Disaster
Management Training which were imparted to Community Volunteer to
build better capacity and their skill towards disaster preparedness and
capacity building.
   The Course Completion Certificate alongwith Identity Cards
were distributed to the trained Community Volunteers (Aapda Mitra) on
the occasion, a press release from Directorate of Disaster Management
said.

examination for Martic Level posts to be held on 09.07.2023.
    The details should be submitted before 12 noon of 07.07.2023 to consider
the postponement. Only those candidates who submit their details before
the above time period shall be considered for postponement of exam, a
press release from DHS said.

Computer Based Test for recruitment to various posts in Health Deptt....
(Contd. from page 1)

Port Blair, July 6
      Online applications
have been invited for the
post of Veterinary
Compounder (Group-C),
level-4 (Rs. 25500-81100)
in the Department of
Animal Husbandry &
Veterinary Services,
Andaman & Nicobar
Administration who
possess the required
educational qualification
from a recognized Board/

Online applications invited for post of

Veterinary Compounder in Deptt. of AH&VS
Institution. The
applications will be
received from 06.07.2023
from 11 am and the closing
date is 04.08.2023 till 12
midnight. Only online
application would be
accepted. The details in
respect of the post and
requirements i.e. Vacancy,
Educational Qualification,
Eligible Criteria and other
instructions are available
online at the Department

of Animal Husbandry &
Veterinary Services https:/
/ w w w . a h v s .
andaman.gov.in  and
website of Andaman &
Nicobar Administration
www.andaman.gov.in
For applying online, the
applicants may visit the
portal  https://
e r e c r u i t m e n t .
andaman.gov.in/crap, a
press release from Deptt.
of AH&VS said.

Port Blair, July 6
   In continuation to the
vacancy notice
published in the Daily
Telegrams by
Directorate of
Agriculture, A&N
Administration on
08.05.2023 for the posts

of Agriculture Officer,
A g r i c u l t u r e
Engineering Assistant
and Agriculture
Assistant, all concerned
have been informed
that the date of written
examination to the post
of Agriculture Assistant

Recruitment to various posts in Agriculture Deptt.

Date of written exam rescheduled;
to be held on Aug. 23

scheduled on
20.08.2023 has been
rescheduled and will
be now held on
23.08.2023 due to
administrative reasons,
a press release from
Directorate of
Agriculture said.

Provisional Statement of Marks of eligible candidates...
(Contd. from page 1)

candidature based on any documentary evidence. After re-verification of
documents, a provisional merit list will be published.
    Further, it is informed that the candidates may submit their claims/objections
in person during working hours at Shiksha Sadan, Port Blair or through email
itmiscell.edn@gmail.com within 7 days w.e.f 7th July, 2023. Claims and objections
received after the due date will not be considered, a press release from DDE
(Perl) said.

AH&VS, Dr. Vivin Vincent, HoD Community Medicine, ANIIMS, Dr. P
Vijaychari, Director, RMRC and Dr. Debashish Battacharya, Senior Scientist,
CIARI. In his inaugural address, Dr. Eknath Chakurkar insisted on the 'One
Health Approach to Health' where he emphasized that all the stakeholders
must come to a common platform to share the data on Zoonoses and to take
early preventive measures to prevent and control the disease.
   Detailed presentations and elaborate discussion on various aspects of
Zoonoses among human and animal population and the need to identify areas
of threat due to agriculture and transmission of zoonoses in these Islands were
held. It was unanimously decided by the participants that a common platform
must be established to achieve the target of 'One Health Approach to Health'
and sharing of inter-departmental data to foresee any outbreak of zoonoses
diseases in these Islands. The program concluded with the vote of thanks
proposed by Dr. Rohit, Senior Project Officer, UNDP, a press release from DD
(Health), DHS said.

Symposium on 'Preparedness for future ...
(Contd. from page 1)

MP condoles death
Port Blair, July 6

    The Member of

Parliament, A&N Islands,

Shri Kuldeep Rai Sharma,

has mourned the demise of

Shri T. Rammurthi (56

years), Andaman Labour

Force, PMB, S/o Shri

Simmadri and a resident of

Dairy Farm area. MP has

also mourned the demise of

Shri Jagadish Babu

Panigrahi (Priest), S/o

Panigrahi, a resident of

Dairy Farm. Both of them

passed away this evening at

G. B.Pant Hospital, a press

release from MP Office said.

& 18.7.2023 for Junior Investigator (DES and AH & VS) and 19.7.2023 for
Senior Investigator/ Assistant Statistical Officer at Dr. B.R.Ambedkar Institute
of Technology, Pahargaon.  The hall tickets will be available for downloading
from online portal of https://erecruitment.andaman.gov.in/CRAP from
07.07.2023 from 4 pm onwards.  Candidates have been advised to download
hall ticket directly from the portal.  The timing, venue and other details of
examination are available in the hall ticket.
    Candidates who have applied during 2020 for Senior Investigator post vide
vacancy notice dated 30.9.2020 (uploaded in website on 1.10.2020) and
provisionally shortlisted have been allotted new Registration number for
downloading the admit card. The list with new registration number is available
in online portal of https://erecruitment.andaman.gov.in/CRAP and https://
www.andaman.gov.in. Those candidates who have re-applied as per the new
vacancy notice and their names appear in both the list (new & old) are removed
from the old list to avoid duplicity.
    Special attention has been invited from all the candidates/applicants who
have applied for the post of Senior Investigator/Assistant Statistical Officer
that any kind of outcome of recruitment process will be subject to outcome of
OA No.802/2023 (Shyamal Roy & Ors. Vs UoI & Ors.) filed in Hon'ble CAT,
Kolkata.
    The Visually Handicapped candidates opting to avail the assistance of
Scribes has to approach/inform the Directorate of Economics & Statistics before
12th of July, 2023.
     For any clarifications, candidate can contact the Nodal Officer (Recruitment),
Directorate of Economics & Statistics over phone No.03192-232476 on all
working days i.e. Monday to Friday between 10 am & 5 pm, a press release
from Directorate of Economics & Statistics said.

Exam for Junior Investigator (DES and AH & VS) to be...
(Contd. from page 1)

Baratang, July 6
       As part of the
observance of 74th Van
Mahotsav, a ceremonial
tree planting programme
was organized by the
Baratang Forest Division
in the premises of St.
Anne's School,
Sundergarh, Baratang
yesterday. Shri P.K.Paul,
IFS, Divisional Forest
Officer, Baratang
addressed the students
and highlighted the
importance of Van
Mahotsava. He urged the
students to become
ambassadors for
protecting environment

by planting and
protecting the seedlings.
The Head Mistress of the
school expressed her
happiness as the school
was selected for such a
noble cause.
    On the occasion, 134
students including staff
members of the School

participated and
planted fruit bearing
seedlings including
Guava, Lemon,
Cashewnut, Papaya,
Amla, Jackfruit,
Pomegranate, Custard
Apple etc., a press
release from DFO,
Baratang said.

74th Van Mahotsav observed by

Baratang Forest Division
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VITALA PUBLIC SCHOOL 

Hope Town, South Andaman 
Phone No. 03192-258294 

Applications are invited from eligible candidates for the following 
posts: 

Sl. No. Name of Posts Educational Qualification 

1. PGT (Mathematics) M.Sc. B.Ed. 

2. PGT (Political Science) M.A. B.Ed. 

3.  PGT (Physics) M.Sc. B.Ed. 

4. PGT (Male) (Physical 
Eduction) 

M.P.Ed. 

5.  GTT (Science) B.Sc.B.Ed. 

Desirable: Knowledge of Computer 

Interested eligible candidates can submit the resume on or before 
10th July, 2023 in school office. 

Principal 

 

AFFIDAVIT 

    I, G. AKASH KUMAR, S/o Shri G. Prasad, R/o Nayagaon Village, under Port Blair Tehsil, South 
Andaman District, do hereby solemnly affirm and declare as follows: 
1. That I am permanent resident of these Islands and residing at abovementioned address. 

2. That my actual and correct name is G. AKASH KUMAR and my mother’s actual and correct 

name is G. JAYA MADHAVI as recorded in my CBSE 12th Pass Certificate and other records which 
are available with me. 
3. That my name and my mother’s name has been entered in my CBSE 10th Pass Certificate 

bearing Sl. No. 353345 as G. AKASH, S/o JAYA MADHAVI instead of G. AKASH KUMAR, S/o G. 

JAYA MADHAVI. 
4. That the abovesaid name G. AKASH, S/o JAYA MADHAVI and G. AKASH KUMAR, S/o G. JAYA 
MADHAVI are belongs to one and the same person. 

5. That I swear this affidavit for the purpose to declaring that the abovesaid names are belongs to 
me, henceforth my name shall be treated as G. AKASH KUMAR, S/o G. JAYA MADHAVI for all 

official and non-official purpose. 
   That the abovementioned statement made by me is true and correct to the best of my knowledge 

and belief. 
Place: Port Blair 
Date: 13.06.2023                                                                                                                   Deponent      

 

(TFG RC.No.84/2023) 

FORM J 

[See Rule 135 (3)] 
(Notice of Mutation to interested Person) 

1. Smti. Lailun Nisha, W/o Late Mohammed Salim 
2. Smti. Zubaida Begum, D/o Late Mohammed Salim 
3. Smti. Mehrun Nisha, D/o Late Mohammed Salim 

4. Smti. Rasheeda Begum, D/o Late Mohamemd Salim 
5. Shri Anwar Ali, S/o Late Mohammed Salim 
6. Smti. Fareeda Begum, D/o Late Mohammed Salim 
7. Smti. Kherun Nisha, D/o Late Mohammed Salim 

8. Smti. Jaibun Nisha, D/o Late Mohammed Salim 
9. Pradhan, GP. Bambooflat-I 
10. Notice Board.  
     Notice is hereby given that mutation entry as specified below has been made in the 

Mutation Register of Village Bambooflat. Copy of which has been affixed at Notice Board of 
Patwarkhana, Bambooflat on 14/02/2023. You are requested to file your objection, if any to 
the entry within 15 days of the publication of the notice. 

Particulars of Mutation Entry 

Village: Bambooflat 

Sl. No. 
of 

entry 

Date of  
entry 

Nature of acquisition of right and its 
details 

Holding affected  

Holding 

No. 

Sy. 

No. 

Area in 

Hects 

1 2 3 4 5 6 

 
465 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 
14/02/2023 

    After the death of the recorded 
tenant namely Mohammed Salim his 

daughter Smti. Fareeda Begum, R/o 
Bambooflat has requested for mutation 
of her father’s landed property 
(mentioned alongside in Col 4, 5 & 6) 

situated at Bambooflat village jointly in 
favour of all legal heirs namely:- 
 1. Smti. Lailun Nisha - Wife 
 2. Smti. Zubaida Begum – Daughter 

 3. Smti. Mehrun Nisha - Daughter  
 4. Smti. Rasheeda Begum- Daughter 
 5.Shri Anwar Ali- Son 
 6. Smti. Fareeda Begum- Daughter  

 7. Smti. Kherun Nisha- Daughter  
 8. Smti. Jaibun Nisha – Daughter 
       Presently as per record the landed 
property is recorded in favour of 

Mohammed Salim, S/o Shahabudin. 

C.R 
H/Site 

684 0.0340 

Date: 14/02/2023 
                          Sd/- 

Patwari  
Circle No.(3) 

Ferrargunj Tehsil 

 

PLOTS ON ATR 

OGRABRAJ 

Plots starting from 200 Sq. 
mtrs. developed and 
marked area available for 
sale at prime location of 
Ograbraj, ATR attached. 
NOTE: PLOTS FALL UNDER 
PRIME RESIDENTIAL ZONE 
AS PER PLANNING, FOR 
FURTHER ENQUIRIES ON 
SAME CONTACT:  

+91 7063955285, +91 
9474286187, 

+919933209265 

HOME SERVICE 
AC, Fridge, Washing Machine, Deep-
Fridge, Micro Woven Repairing. 

Contact: 8900942650/ 9593464551 

 

GARAGE EQUIPMENTS FOR SALE 
- Computerized Wheel Alignment 
Machine (Elgi) (1 No.) 
- Two Post Lift 3 tonnes (Elgi) – 1 No. 
- Automatic AC Gas Charging Machine 
(BOSCH) – 1 No. 
- Car Washer 3 HP (Elgi) – 1 No. 
- Hydralic Lift for Car Washing (Elgi) – 4 
tonnes – 1 No. 

Contact: 7547960798 

 

LAND FOR SLAE 

MR Single Patta near Chouldari Market 
also 200 Sq, mtr. Each at Humfreygunj, 
Aniket & Kadakchang. Ph: 9933214853 

ANDAMAN AND NICOBAR ADMINISTRATION

DIRECTORATE OF CIVIL SUPPLIES & CONSUMER AFFAIRS
 Port Blair dated 6th July, 2023

NOTIFICATION

           No.    /2022 F.No.1-6/SC/ANI/Rule/2021/      In exercise of powers conferred under

Section 102 of the Consumer Protection Act, 2019, and in pursuance of Notification

No.S.O.3997(E) dated 03.11.2020 issued by GOI, Ministry of Consumer Affairs, Food and

Public Distribution, the Lieutenant Governor (Administrator), Andaman and Nicobar Islands

hereby makes the following Rules to amend the Andaman and Nicobar Islands Consumer

Protection Rules, 2021 published in the Andaman Nicobar Gazette, Extraordinary No.85 dated

25th August 2021, vide Notification No.77/2021/F.No.1-6/SC/ANI/Rule/2021/1097 dated 25th

August 2021, namely ;

"1. Short Title and Commencement: -

  (i) These Rules may be called as Andaman and Nicobar Islands Consumer Protection

(Amendment) Rules,2023.

     (ii) They shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Sub-rule (4) of Rule 12 of the Andaman and Nicobar Islands Consumer Protection Rules,

2021 (hereinafter called Principal Rules) published vide notification No.77/2021/F.No.1-6/SC/
ANI/Rule/2021/1097 dated 25.08.2021 shall be substituted and reads as under:-
 "(4) Pending creation or sanction of regular posts, the President of District Commission shall
receive a consolidated remuneration of Rupees Two lakhs per month subject to deductions of
the amount of gross monthly pension so received by him/her from the gross amount of monthly
pay and allowances payable to him/her.
Each of the Members of District Commission shall receive consolidated remuneration of rupees
forty thousand as a stopgap arrangement.
In the event of selection of a Pensioner as member of the District Commission the salary of that
member shall be fixed as Rs. 1,00,000/- subject to deduction of the amount of gross monthly
pension so received by him/her  from the gross amount of monthly pay and allowances
payable to him/her. The maximum payable amount after deduction of gross monthly pension
shall not be above 40000/- .
In the event of the creation of regular posts of the President and Members of the District
Commission in accordance with  new Rules, the President and Members so appointed under
the new Rules shall get their respective salary in terms of sub-rules (1), (2) and (3) of rule 12
subject to reduction as contemplated under sub-rule (5).  The aforesaid amount of salary of the
President and Members of District Commission on regular pay structure shall only be released
in case of appointment on regular basis against sanctioned posts under due process of
selection and appointment.
Provided that the Registrar of the High Court, Calcutta, Circuit Bench at Port Blair shall continue
to function as President, District Commission in addition to his own substantive function till the
appointment  of the post of President on a regular basis  as per extant Rules or appointment
of an appropriate  incumbenton contract basis. So long the Registrar, High Court, Calcutta,
Circuit Bench at Port Blair continues with the additional charge of President, District Commission,
A & N Islands  and he shall be entitled to receive a remuneration of rupees four thousand per
day of sitting subject to a maximum of rupees fifty thousand per month and each of the
Members shall be entitled to receive consolidated remuneration of Rupees Three thousand five
hundred per day of sitting subject to a maximum of rupees forty thousand per month as a
stopgap arrangement."
3. Sub-rule (4) of Rule 17 of the Andaman & Nicobar Islands Consumer Protection Rules,2021
(hereinafter called Principle Rules) published vide notification No.77/2021/F.No.1-6/SC/ANI/
Rule/2021/1097 dated 25.08.2021 shall be substituted  and reads as below:-
"(4) Pending the creation of regular posts, the President of State Commission shall receive
consolidated remuneration of Rupees Three lakhs subject to deductions of the amount of gross
monthly pension so received by him/her from the gross amount of monthly pay and allowances
payable to him/her.
Each of the Members of State Commission shall receive consolidated monthly remuneration of
rupees fifty thousand as a stopgap arrangement.
In the event of selection of a Pensioner as member the salary of member shall be fixed as
Rs.1,20,000/- subject to deductions of the amount of gross monthly pension so received by
him/her from the gross amount of monthly pay and allowances payable to him/her. The
maximum payable amount after deductions shall not be above 50000/- .

NOTICE INVITING e-TENDERS 

  The Executive Engineer, Panchayati Raj Institution, South Andaman Division-I on 

behalf of thePradhan, Gram Panchayat, Neil Kendra, Shaheed Dweep invites online item 
rate tender (in CPWD form-8) from bonafide and experienced contractors for the below 

mentioned work. 

1. NIT No. EE/PRI/SAD-I/SBM G/2023-24/21 Name of Work: Construction of Community 
Sanitary Complex near RO Plant Neil Kendra under Gram Panchayat Shaheed 

Dweep.Estimated Cost: Rs.7,22,462/-,Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.14,449/-,Time of 
Completion:Three (03) Months, Tender Fee: Rs.500/- & last date & time of submission of bid: 

14/07/2023 (1500 hrs.) 

  The tender forms and other details can be obtained from the website 
https://eprocure.andaman.gov.in. 

Tender ID: - 2023  RDPRI  10805  1            
Executive Engineer 

Panchayati Raj Institution 

South Andaman Division-I 

I.D. No. 10188                                                    Junglighat, Port Blair, South Andaman 

 

TO LET 

2 BHK RCC Flat (newly built) available 
on rent at Dollygunj Opp. Shiv Colony 
Junction along side main road. Contact 
No. 9434283556 / 9434289172 

 
TO LET 

1 BHK and 2 BHK Room available 
for rent at Doctor’s Colony, 
Garacharma. Contact: 7003118157 

TO LET 

2 BHK Room 2nd Floor and 2 Nos. Single 
Room Ground Floor available for rent at 
Dean St., Junglighat. Pl. Contact: 
9474293212 / 7063993712 

 

TO LET 

Shop available for rent at first floor 
suitable for Showroom, Office, 
Gym etc. at prime location near 
Prince Honda Showroom, ATR 
road, Dollygunj. No. of Shutters-3 
with attached toilet. Total Carpet 
area 100 Sq. mtrs. Contact Ph. 
No. 9933233352, 9531823031 

 

NOTICE INVITING e-TENDERS 

No. PN/DB/CD-I/RGT/2022-23/2186           
   The Executive Engineer, Construction Division-I, A.P.W.D., Rangat invites on behalf of the 
President of India, online Item Rate bid from the approved and eligible Contractors of the 
Andaman PWD or for all contractors irrespective of their enlistment in APWD or any other 
Govt. Department subject to the condition that they have experience on executing the relevant 
magnitude of work as per CPWD Works Manual and with other GOI organizations in these 
islands and do not have any adverse remarks: 
NIT No.06/DB/E&M/CD-I/RGT/2023-24 e-Tender ID No. 2023_APWD_10713_1 Name of 
work. Supplying, Installation of Energy Efficiency BLDC AC Ceiling Fan in Govt. Schools 

under the jurisdiction of CD-I, Rangat. Estimated Cost: Rs. 9,29,681/-, Earnest Money : Rs. 
18,594/- & Time of completion: 01 Month, Last Date of Submission of bid: 17.07.2023 at 
3.00 PM. 

   The bid forms and other details can be obtained from the website eprocure.andaman.gov.in. 
Executive Engineer 

I.D. No. 10155                                                                                         CD-I, APWD, Rangat 

 

NOTICE INVITING e-TENDERS 

   The Executive Engineer, Panchayati Raj Institution, South Andaman Division-I on 
behalf of the Pramukh, Panchayat Samiti, Ferrargunj invites online item rate tender (in 
CPWD form-8) from bonafide and experienced contractors for the below mentioned work. 

1. NIT No. EE/PRI/SAD-I/GEN/2023-24/22 Name of Work: Construction of Retaining Wall 

with CC Drain from K.Appa Rao house to T. Veeraswamy house at Ward No. 08 under 
Bambooflat-I Gram Panchayat by Samiti.(Revised Estimate) Estimated Cost: Rs. 9,41,675/-, 

Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.18,834/-,Time of Completion: - Six (06) Months, Tender Fee: 
Rs.500/- & last date & time of submission of bid: 12/07/2023 (1500 hrs.) 

  The tender forms and other details can be obtained from the website 

https://eprocure.andaman.gov.in. 
Tender ID: 2023 RDPRI 10780 1            

Executive Engineer 
Panchayati Raj Institution 

 South Andaman Division-I 

I.D. No. 10175                                                          Junglighat, Port Blair, South Andaman 

 

 Admiral D.K. Joshi
PVSM, AVSM, YSM, NM, VSM (Retd.)

Lieutenant Governor
Andaman and Nicobar Islands

By order and in the name of the Lt. Governor
Sd/-

Registrar
State Consumer Dispute Redressal Commission

A&N Islands

NOTICE INVITING e-TENDERS 

  The Executive Engineer, Panchayati Raj Institution, South Andaman Division-I on 
behalf of the Pramukh, Panchayat Samiti, Ferrargunj invites online item rate tender (in 
CPWD form-8) from bonafide and experienced contractors for the below mentioned work: 
1. NIT No. EE/PRI/SAD-I/GEN/2023-24/23 Name of Work: Construction of Shed in Hindu 
Graveyard under Mannarghat Gram Panchayat by Samiti. Estimated Cost: Rs. 9,70,056/-, 
Earnest Money Deposit: Rs.19,401/-, Time of Completion: Six (06) Months, Tender Fee: 
Rs.500/- & last date & time of submission of bid: 12/07/2023 (1500 hrs.) 
The tender forms and other details can be obtained from the website 
https://eprocure.andaman.gov.in. 
Tender ID: 2023 RDPRI 10782 1                                                               Executive Engineer  

Panchayati Raj Institution 
South Andaman Division-I 

I.D. No. 10176                                                    Junglighat, Port Blair, South Andaman 

 

Read 
Daily Telegrams 

PRESS NOTE  

  All the Un-employed Co-operative Societies/Co-operative Societies duly 
registered in the Department of Registrar of Co-operative Societies (both Civil & 
Electrical) wish to enroll with this Zilla Parishad, N&M Andaman are hereby 
directed to furnish necessary relevant documents of the societies in full shape 
shall be submitted in this Office of the Chief Executive Officer, Zilla Parishad, 
N&M Andaman, Mayabunder within 15 days from the first date of publication of 
this notice  for preparation of Roster for five year term.  The following 
documents are required as follows: 
1. Copy of previous financial year Audit report. 
2. Self attested copy of Engineer certificate & Aadhaar card with Contact   
   number along with undertaking by technical staff and also from Co- operative  
   Society concerned. 
3. Self attested copy of PAN Card of concerned Co-operative Society. 
4. Self attested Aadhaar Card copy of both President & Secretary of Co-  
    operative Society. 
5. Details of member and Office holding Member in Society concerned alongwith  
   Aadhaar number. 
6. Copy of proceedings of last minutes of meeting of society. 
7. Copy of Registration Certificate of Society concerned.  
8. Copy of Bye-Laws required for new enrolment. 
9. Copy of GST Registration of concerned Co-operative Society and if not     
   registered, an undertaking may be submitted by the concerned Co-operative  
   society stating an annual turnover of Society is less than Rs.40 Lakhs in a  
   financial year as per GST norm. 
10.  Copy of Bank Account details of respective Societies if any, Further, to note   

 that in case any Co- operative society fails to submit the above said              
 documents in full shape within the time period mentioned above, their          
 application will not be entertain for enrolment in the Roster of Zilla   

         Parishad, N & M Andaman. 
Officer in Charge(Admn.) 

I.D. No. 10190                                                                Zilla Parishad, N&M A. 

NOTICE INVITING e-TENDERS 

  The Executive Engineer, Panchayati Raj Institution, South Andaman Division-I on 

behalf of the Pradhan, Gram Panchayat, R.K. Pur, Little Andaman invites online item rate 
tender(in CPWD form-8) from bonafide and experienced for the below mentioned work. 

1. NIT NO. EE/PRI/SAD-I/GEN/2022-23/131 Name of Work: Repair and Maintenance of 
Community Hall at Ward No. 08 at R.K.Pur under R.K.Pur, Gram Panchayat. (Re-Tender) 
Estimated Cost: Rs.11,54,892/-, Earnest Money Deposit: Rs. 23,098/-, Time of 

Completion: Five (05) Months, Tender Fee: Rs. 500/- & last date & time of submission of bid:  
14/07/2023 (1500 hrs.) 

The tender forms and other details can be obtained from the website 
https://eprocure.andaman.gov.in. 
Tender ID: - 2023  RDPRI  10794  1                                                          Executive Engineer 

Panchayati Raj Institution, South Andaman Division-I 
I.D. No. 10185                                                            Junglighat, Port Blair, South Andaman 
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DISCLAIMER 
    Readers are requested to verify 
and make appropriate enquiries to 
satisfy themselves about the 
veracity of an advertisement before 
responding to any advertisement 
published in this newspaper. 
    The publisher of this newspaper, 
does not vouch for the authenticity 
of any advertisement or advertiser 
or for any of the advertisers 
products and services. 
    The Owner, Publisher, Printer, 
Employees of this newspaper shall 
not be held responsible/liable in any 
manner whatsoever for any claims 
and/or damages/consequences for 
advertisements in this newspaper. 

KAMARAJ ENGLISH MEDIUM SCHOOL, SENIOR SECONDARY, 

BROOKSHABAD, PORT BLAIR 

VACANCY NOTICE 

Sl. 
No. 

Name of the 
Posts 

Educational Qualifications 

1 PGT 
(Mathematics) 

Educational Qualifications : M.Sc. B.Ed. (Maths) 
Desirable:  Minimum two years teaching experience. 

2 GTT (Tamil) 
 

Educational Qualifications:  B.A,  B. Ed. in Tamil 
Literature (For Teaching Third Language – Tamil) 
Desirable:     Minimum two years teaching experience. 

3 Office Clerk Required a well qualified Office Clerk.  He / She 
should be well versed in office management, should 
have good writing skill and knowledge of Tally. 
Desirable :     Minimum Five years experience. 

4 Driver  
(School Bus) 

Educational Qualifications:  XthPass with HMV Licence 
Desirable:    Minimum two years HMV driving 
experience 

       Interested  qualified  candidates may submit their application along with Bio-
data, self attested xerox copies of all educational certificates to the Secretary, 
Kamaraj English Medium School, Brookshabad, Port Blair- 744112 on or 
before 08/07/2023 by 3 p.m. A passport size photo should also be affixed in the 
application form in the appropriate place. 

SECRETARY 

24th DEATH ANNIVERSARY
ON 07.07.2023

Late ANATH CHANDRA BEPARI
R/o Nimbudera, Middle Andaman

Inserted by :

Arti (Daughter), Mohon (Son-in-Law) Akash

(Grandson), Parimal (Son), Pabita (Son),

Pradeep (Son),& all Family members

In Loving Memory of

24th DEATH

ANNIVERSARY
ON 07.07.2023

Saju
Bird Line, Port Blair

Inserted by:

M Vijayamma (Mother) Sangita Dinesh,

Dinesh Babu & Harshitha Dinesh

OBITUARY
    With profound grief and sorrow we inform

the sad demise of our beloved Pandit-

JAGADISH BABU PANIGRAHI (Greshan) who

left for his heavenly abode on 06/07/2023.

Lord Sree Krishna Temple Committee

Dairy Farm, Port Blair

We request your kind presence to grace

the final rites for the eternal peace of the

departed soul on 07/07/2023 from his

residence, Dairy Farm.

NOTICE 

     This is in continuation of the Vacancy Notice published in the Daily Telegrams 
by Directorate of Agriculture, A& N Administration on 08.05.2023 for the posts of 
Agriculture Officer, Agriculture Engineering Assistant and Agriculture Assistant.  In 
this regard, it is for the information of all concerned that the date of written 
examination to the post of Agriculture Assistant scheduled on 20.08.2023  
has been rescheduled and will be now held on 23.08.2023 due to  
administrative reasons. 

Joint Director (Agri.), HQ 
I.D. No. 10194                                                               Directorate of Agriculture 

NOTICE 

    It is brought to notice of the General Public of the Pahalgaon Zilla Parishad 
Constituency and adjacent Zilla Parishad Constituency (i.e. Mayabunder & 
Harinagar) regarding Auction of 10 Rooms for shopping/Marketing  situated at 
Tugapur under the Pahalgaon Constituency, Zilla Parishad, N & M Andaman 
issued by the Office of Zilla Parishad, N & M Andaman on 03.07.2023 has been 
published on 05.07.2023 under the Announcement Section (What’s New) of 
https://www.andaman.gov.in/ann_allfor details of Notice. 
    Those who have willing to apply for auction shall be visited above said web 
site and submitted application along with EMD and self attested copy of Public 
Notice, necessary documents etc. latest by 4.00PM on 20.07.2023 in the Office 
of Zilla Parishad (Chief Accounts officer, Accounts Section), North & Middle 
Andaman, Mayabunderand Auction date on 21.07.2023. 
 

Officer-Incharge(Admn.) 
I.D. No. 10195                                        Zilla Parishad, N & M A, Mayabunder. 

 

(TFG RC.No.224/2023) 

FORM J 
[See Rule 135 (3)] 

(Notice of Mutation to interested Person) 
 

1. Shri D. Ashi Devan, 2. Smti. D. Santhamma, 3. Smti. Hemawathi 
4. Smti. D. Shamalamma, 5. Smti. Gangamma,  
6. The Pradhan Gram Panchayat,Namunaghar, 7. Notice Board.  
    Notice is hereby given that mutation entry as specified below has been made in the Mutation 
Register of Village Namunagharacopy of which has been affixed at Notice Board ofPatwarkhana, 
Namunaghar& Panchayat Office, Namunaghar on 01/03/2023. You are requested to file your 
objection, if any to the entry within 15 days of the publication of the notice. 

Particulars of Mutation Entry 
Village: Namunaghar 

Sl. No. of 
entry 

Date of  
entry 

Nature of acquisition of right and its 
details  

Holding affected  

Holding 
No. 

Sy. 
No. 

Area in 
Hects 

1 2 3 4 5 6 

545 
 
 
 
 
 
 

01/03/2023       Consequent on demise of D.  
Gannaiah his son D. Ashi Devan has 
requested for mutation of landed 
property in favour of joint names of all  
dependent as follows:- 
1. D. Ashi Devan – son 
2. D. Santhamma – wife  
3. D. Hemawathi –daughter  
4. D. Gangamma– daughter 
5. D. Shamalamma– daughter 
       As per records subject land 
stands recorded in favour of Shri D.  
Gannaiah, S/o D. Satiya. 

House site 
Register –I 

Page 
No.48 

620 0.0200 

Date: 01/03/2023                                                                      Sd./- 
Patwari, Circle No.(6) 

Ferrargunj Tehsil 

Son, Wife & Daughter 

of Late D. Gannaiah 

SITUATION VACANT

 MAHINDRA & MAHINDRA LTD.

Please forward your resume to:  hr@jadwet.com

Call: 03192-232271

Jadwet Trading Company Pvt. Ltd.

Mohanpura Petrol Bunk, 1st Floor, Opp.to Municipal Council,Port Blair

Invites young qualified & experienced professionals for our Dealership

operations in Port Blair, Andaman & Nicobar Islands, Port Blair Branch

1) Sales Executive (Graduate with minimum experience.)

2) Electrician-Automobile (1 year Experience in 4 Wheeler Industries)

3) Service Advisor (1 year Experience in 4 Wheeler Industries)

4) Floor Supervisor (1 year Experience in 4 Wheeler Industries)

5. Digital Marketing Executive (Graduation with 1year experience in Digital

Marketing)

6) Technician (ITI with 1 year Experience in 4 Wheeler)

7) Hostess (Graduation with good communication skills)

8) Car washing

9) Tele Caller (1 year experience)

SITUATION VACANT 
Hiring Location: Swaraj Dweep 

Store In-charge  
(Experienced & Freshers can also apply) – 1 No. 

DE FORET HOTELS & RESORTS PVT. LTD. 
If interested, Please send your CV: admin@deforetresorts.com / 

contact@deforetresorts.com 

 

WANTED 
Travel Professional       Tourist vehicle 
B2B Travel Sales Executive  On Lease basis for 2 years 
B2C Travel Sales Executive  Earn Monthly: Rs.30,000 to Rs.50,000 
Tour Guide   (without Fuel & Driver) 
Experience:- 3 + Years           Send your Vehicle Registration Certificate 
Salary:-Rs.30,000   Wanted: Driver (10 Nos.) 
Send your resume 

Andaman Holidays & Tours 
Email: andamanht@gamil.com      WhatsApp: 7695061377 / 7695061399 

 
JOB VACANCY 

1. Position: Reservation Executive (Post: 06 – Male / Female) 
** Minimum Qualification: 12th Pass. Fluency in English in Reading & Writing, can Speak to 

Customer and Agents & Basic Computer Knowledge with E-mails is mandatory. 

2. Driver for Tourist Vehicle – 02 Nos. (Male) with Driving License holder will be preferred. 
** Experienced Candidates will be given first Preference & Freshers may also apply. 
Interested candidate may Walk-in Interview along with Bio-Data and 01 Passport size photo, 

Timing between 10.00 am and 5.30 pm. (Attractive Salary with Incentive, according to Leads 
Conversion) 

Andaman Great Holidays 
Nearby VKV School, 1st Floor Tiptop Furniture Building, Lamba Line.  

Contact: 9933297130 / 7695023150 / 8373090130 

 

CHIPTECH SOLUTION 
 LAPTOP MOTHERBOARD REPAIR 

 DEAD LED/LCD TV REPAIR 

 CCTV INSTALLATION ALL TYPES 

 LAPTOP SERVICE 

 DESKTOP SERVICE 

 PRINTER TONER AVAILABLE ALL TYPE 

 NETWORKING SOLUTION  

 CALL BASED SERVICES ALL DEPARTMENT 

BEHIND POINEER CHICKEN CENTRE JUNGLIGHAT 

MOB:  9775141786/9933282249 

 

DIRECTORATE OF SHIPPING SERVICES 
ANDAMAN AND NICOBAR ADMINISTRATION 

CORRIGENDUM NOTICE  

     Please refer to this office “SEVA SUCHNAYEIN” issued vide.No-
M/Afl(Opn)/6-1/2023/556 dated 05.07.2023 with regard to the  issuance of 
passenger tickets from 07.07.2023 onwards for the Foreshore Sector scheduled 
between 09.07.2023 to 14.07.2023 may be read as “09.07.2023 to 
16.07.2023”.Other content will remain unchanged.  

Deputy Director (SS)  
A&N Admn. 

SITUATION VACANT 

Required Sales Executive Male / Female, Experienced or 
Fresher for a reputed Jewellery Showroom. Walk-in Interview 
with updated resume with a passport size photo. 
Rajarajeswari Jewellers, Sastri Road, Aberdeen Bazar. Contact: 8900908777 

TO LET 

2 BHK Flat @ Dollygunj Industrial Estate 
near Karan Trading with individual car 
parking, 24 × 7 water supply, Modular 
Kitchen, 2 attached baths in ground floor 
is available for rent.  

Contact: 9933266662, 9434266662 

 

MATRIMONIAL 
Seeking suitable match for 40 
years old male, 168 Cms. Height, 
working in Govt. Sector. The match 
should preferably be in between 
31-35 from a decent Hindu family.  

Interested persons may please 

Contact @ 8509335763 

 

WANTED 

Sales Boy for Orion 
Pest Solution Office 
at Phoenix Bay. 
Minimum 12th Pass 
with 5 years 
experience. Should 
have two wheeler. 
Good Salary.  
Call: 9088123456 

SITUATION VACANT 
Wanted Sales Boy for Men’s 

Garment Showroom 
Salary – Rs.13000/- 

Sungrace Apparels 
14 - Marthoma Shopping 

Complex 
Goal Ghar, Port Blair 

Ph. 9933284277 

 
KURUP MOTORS 

A Premium Car Detailing Studio @ Dollygunj 

WANTED 

1. Car Washing Boy 
2. Field Marketing Executive with 
Two Wheeler 

Contact: +91 8001401888 

We Work for U 
Electrical Wiring’ Plumbing All 
types of Fabrication and 
Maintenance and Repair works. 
All types of CIVIL Works 
All type of Aluminum works. 

Just Call  
Ph: 9531911958 

WANTED 
Salesgirls – 02 Nos. 

(IXth Pass with Basic Computer 
Knowledge) for a Handicraft 
Showroom at Middle Point  
send Resume- 9434267010 & 
Call: 7063993705 

 

WANTED 
Delivery Boy – 10 Nos. 
attractive Salary + Incentives, 
Part Time / Full Time, 
Location: Haddo.  

Contact: 9679548423, 
WhatsApp: 9679548422 

 

60th Happy Wedding Anniversary
On 07/07/2023

Shri P. Joseph & Smti. Saleena
R/o Pokhadera, Mayabunder, Ph. 9531850843

Best wishes from: J. Anand Raj  (Son), Epsy Mary (Daughter-in-Law),

Abhishek & Annie (Grandson & Daughter), R/o Haddo

UCMACS ABACUS 

MAKE YOUR CHILD GENIUS IN MATHS 

Age Limit: 5 to 13 .   Monthly fee Rs.700/- 

Brain Development, Memory Power, Speed in Maths, 

Concentration, Creativity &  Speed  in Writing 
*RGT PUBLIC VIDYALAYA, RGT ROAD* 
*RAO INSTITUTE -- BATHU BASTI. 
*RAO INSTITUTE - JUNGLIGHAT 

9531816575 : 9933269707 

ANDAMAN AND NICOBAR ADMINISTRATION 
DIRECTORATE OF SHIPPING SERVICES 

*** *** *** *** *** 

SUPPLEMENTARY SEVA SUCHNAYEIN 

ALL THE SAILINGS ARE SUBJECT TO 

WEATHER CONDITIONS 

LITTLE ANDAMAN SECTOR: 
 MV Rani Lakshmi will sail for Little Andaman on 09.07.2023 (Sun) at 2100 
Hrs from Phoenix Bay Jetty and will sail for Port Blair on 10.07.2023 (Mon) at 
0600 Hrs from Little Andaman. Return voyage from Little Andaman to Port 
Blair will be a special trip for the candidates appearing for CBT Examination 
scheduled to be held from 11th to 15th July, 2023 at Port Blair.  
  Passenger tickets for the above sailing will be issued on 08.07.2023 
from 0900 Hrs onwards.Passengers may book their tickets from DSS e-ticketing 
portal (https://dss.andaman.gov.in/ShipETicketingWeb/Login.jsp)/STARS 
Ticketing Counters between 9.00 AM to 12.00 PM. 
 

Deputy Director (SS) 
A & N Admn. 

 


